iwm\%[
IR By wfaw [y sgaa (Rl a Sarmavs)

P prafeg

OFFICE OF THE
ADDL. CENTRAL P.F. COMMISSIONER (Delhi & Uttarakhand)
(pHamd wiasg fAfd WTEH-9/ Td AR F316d, HRA WRER)

] (Employees' Provident Fund Organisation-Ministry of Labour & Employment, G.O.l.)
Po Tclo TG wfw ff ¥as/Bhavishya Nidhi Bhawan
K. L. Ianeja 26, SRR e, g, aofiegy FoeRgwe oRa, feeh-s2
28, Community Centre, 8th Floor, Wazirpur Industrial Area, Delhi-52
IR B Ho o amgam (R, a 9.) ®I,/Ph: 011-27376784 Bawi/Fax : 011-27376174
Addl. Central P.F. Commissioner (DL. & Uk) A F-3cl/Email : acc.dlut@epfindia.gov.in
) 3o Mo /D.0. No. : AL (DM”U/M'W/W/W’/ng

* famtid,/Dated : |,\o[bolq_

O
w, = Q
Respected W Yedoch . 41 ’ }g Q
p A, Qb\i‘ \‘N

[ would like to invitc—? your personal attention to prevent illegal theft/
misappropriation of Provident Fund dues paid by the Govt. Departments to various
contractors who grab it and do not fully/ partly deposit the same with concerned
Regional P.F. Commissioners (RPFCs) in respect of such D.E.O’s / housekeeping or other
staff/ casual workers deployed through such contractors.

2. From the investigations made by this office regarding P.F. compliances by the
contractors, in respect of employees deployed at various Govt. Departments / Agencies,
this office has listed out the most common practices adopted by these Contractors to
pocket the Provident Fund Contributions of the poor workers ( ANNEXURE- I ), thus
depriving them of Provident Fund, pension and insurance benefits, it is felt that to take
steps to curtail these malpractices all the Officers and DDO’s be directed to make
themselves aware of the modus operandi of the contractors. Most common excuse
that EPF Act is not applicable on employees drawing more than Rs. 6500/- does not exist
now. A Notification enhancing the wage ceiling limit from 6500/- p.m. to Rs. 15000/-
p.m. has been issued ( ANNEXURE - Il ) and is also available on our website

www.epfindia.gov.in.

3. In this regard | would like to request you to issue suitable directions to all your Heads
of Offices and DDO’s to prevent misappropriation by taking simple precautions
(ANNEXURE -1l ).

ay
Oy DIARY NO.....¢” 75~ -
X oate:...,. N0 [nev(
SN LNT1eha,
aa s 20 [10k2o)y



(2]

4. In case of any complaint against any contractor who is/ was not remitting or less
depositing P.F. contributions into the P.F. accounts of the contractual employees,
information in enclosed format { ANNEXURE ~ IV ) be furnished to concerned Regional
P.F. Commissioner { RPFC) for taking statutory actions under the EPF & MP Act/ u/s
406/ 409 of IPC for misappropriation of P.F. dues. Heads of Offices / DDO’s may also be
directed to file FIR’s against contractors after getting the payment position verified from
the concerned RPFC’s / from our website. Territorial jurisdiction of RPFC’s is enclosed
(ANNEXURE V).

Your directions to DDO’s and information sharing initiative will be instrumental
for social justice to your own contractual employees by way of old age PF/ Pension,
widow/ disablement pension and insurance benefits.

\stha ?\eaem&g _

Yours Sincerely

To

Dr.V. M. Katoch

Secretary

Department of Health Research

Indian Council of Medical Research,

V. Ramalingaswami Bhawan, Ansari Nagar,
New Delhi—110029.



ANNEXURE - |

How the Contractors cheat Gouvt. Departments and swallow P.F. money paid by them.,

Example (i) The contractors claim and get P.F. contributions @ 13.61% of the wages/ salary
from the Govt. Departments. It includes Employer’s Contribution to P.F. @ 12% and Admn. &
insurance Charges @ 1.61%. This 12% Ehwployer's Contribution  together with employees
contribution, which is 12% of the wages / salary, deducted from the salary of such employee is
to be deposited in the Provident Fund & Pension Fund accounts of the individual employees.
For example a contractor claiming P.F. Employer contribution of 1361/- @13.61% on wages of
say 10000/- p.m needs to deposit 12% viz.. Rs. 1200/- (termed as Employer Contribution )
alongwith with 1200/- of Employees Contribution i.e. Rs. 2400/- in the Provident and Pension
Fund accounts of the employee . The Electronic Challan cum Return (ECR) of the said month
shall reflect a total of Rs. 2400/- as remitted dues in respect of the said employee. However,
the Contractor tends to reduce the'wages/ salary of the employee say to Rs. 4000/- ( by either
breaking up the salary into various components like HRA, and other allowances or by reducing
the number of working days of the employee ) and remits only 24% (12% + 12% ) of Rs. 4000/-,
which comes to a total of Rs. 960/- into the Provident and Pension Fund accounts of the
employee thereby pocketing Rs. 1440/- of the contributions meant for the said employee.

(ii) In the above case if there are say 100 employees deployed through the said contractor at a
specific Govt. Department and the contractor adopts similar practice in respect of all the
employees, he will thereby siphon off Rs. 1,44,000/- p.m. of the employees social sccurity
money. Longer the period of contract larger will be the misappropriation of funds.

(iii) Itis also seen that at times the contractor do not remit the P.F. dues at all and pockets the
100 % contributions made by the Govt. Department/ Agency.

Considering a large workforce of contract employees deployed in Govt. Sector, the financial and
social impact of such practice is shocking. To play these tactics the contractors submit fake P.E.
Account Numbers of the employees, fake declarations/ undertakings that the Provident Fund is
being regularly deposited by him, he is also likely to submit fake ECR’s and e—challans. Further,
where the contractor has multiple clients he submits the e-challans of one client to other

clients as proof of P.F. deposit.

It may also be noted that the above examples are only illustrative and not exhaustive.



ANNEXURE - 5

o] "o Fe wwe-33004/99

REGED NQ. . L.-33004/99

Che @a'ﬁette f "

BXTRAORmNAR\
M (- 3—IT-WOE (i)
PART 11—Sectlon 3—Sub-section (i)
it Q@ v
B PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY
R 442) ¢ Taceil, YT, TR 22, 2014 /RTAW 31, 1936
No. 442} NEW DELHI, FRIDAY, AUGUST 22, 2014/SRAVANA 31,1936

N AR IR A1y
sfergEaT
= T 3T, 22 s, 2014

mwﬁeoe(ar ) —FHST wfdww fRfy war whit wrEy oA, 1952 (1952 W o19) &
M 7 & IU-URT (1) F @ qfew grw 5w wxd aftRdl # ONEnT WY BU ¥R AOETT
g wE wRw Ry ooy wiih svRw afifee, 1952 # s s weinew w7 % Rm
frafafaa T awndt &, saiy-
1. (1) wder & wHrh R (R (@anm)aem, 2014 w775

(2) g 01 fAraez, 2014 ¥ Wt gt
2. s widsy Ry AEr, 1952 4-

(%) &TorE 2 F wer (9) ¥ 37 @w (i) F wmE vw 7w oy wiw /Y st W et v BT

¥ & wieqRa far sro,

(F) ATE 26 F IT-IT (6) K ez @ AT AT W A YA A 4T vy g wOd R
siRen e R s,

(1) T 26% ¥ IV (2) ¥ G F o vg; g o 9 oy ﬁ’rﬁm’réaﬁ
57 “qRIE g 9T § Wity R smem

[®1.8. 77-35012/1/2012 waTa-11]
s g e, e afe

197GL2014 (M



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY {ParT U-—S&C. 3(i))

==

feoreft: wAarl wfdwr R o, 1952 s 2 Rasat, 1952 1 geay quwLfR, 1509 510 WRE &
T, W, WO 3, 39 wvw (i) ¥ wwrfw & v off i wra Aoy £ are # Reffe

wRrRg==sl gy wefe vy o an-
(1) a1 fA, 584, Riw 11 %€, 1959
{2) wr.Er R, 1522, Raiw 16 R, 1060
3) ar.Er.fA. 201, Famre 8 wead), 1961
(4) a1.%1.3. 689, Rai® 19 qwpax, 1690

(5) a1 (R, 326(%), e 4 7%, 2001

MINISTRY OF LABOUR AND EMPLOYMENT
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 22nd August, 2014

G.S.R. 608 (E).—In excrcise of the powees conferred by section 5 read with Sub-section(1) of Section 7 of the

Employees’ Provident Funds and Miscellancous Provisions Act, 1952 (19 of 1952), the Cental Government hercby
makes the folowing Scheme, further to amend the Employees' Provident Funds Scheme, 1952, namely:-

1. (1) This Scheme may be called the Employees' Provident Funds (Amendment) Scheme, 2014,
(2} It shall come into force on and from the 1* day of September, 2014,

In the Employees’ Provident Funds Scheme, 1952,

12

(2) in paragraph 2, in clause (), in sub-clause (ii), for the words “six thousand and five hundred rupees”, the
words “ fifteen thousand rupees” shall be substituted;

(b) in paragraph 26, in sub- paragraph (6), for the words “six thousand and five hundred rupees”. the wards
“fifteen thousand rupees” shall be subsrituted;

(¢) in paragraph 26A, in sub-paragraph (2), in the proviso, for the words “six thousand and five huo'red
rupees”, wherever they occur, the words “{ifteen thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

{F. No. $-35012/122012-55.11)

ARUN KUMAR SINHA, Addl. Secy,

Note:- The Employces' Provident Funds Scheme, 1952 was published in the Gazette of India, Part 11, Section 3, Sub-

section (1) dated the 2nd September, 1952 vide potification number S.R.O. 1509 and the relevant paragr2phs
were subsequently emended as follows;—

1. G.S.R, 584, dated the 1 1th May, 1959,
G.S.R. 1522, dated the 6th December, 1960,
G.S.R. 201, dated the 8th February, 1961,
G.S.R. 689, dated the 19th October, 1990,
G.S.R. 326 (E), dated the 4th May, 2001,

M&\—!!J

AT
% R, 22 s, 2014

aT.%7.54.609 (1) —aT=rdy wisx Ffy qur yhf swdw s, 1952 (1952 # 19) B g7 7
t I7-uT (1) F 7T ofSq umr 67 T wew afREdl & @ w0 gU ¥z gear e fm e,
: 1995 & ofrT Feinum T ¥ fFru Fraffa drem aardt 8, safy-
t. (1) ug AT FHSTE BT (Feivum) Do, 2014 g



{9 1 -RvE 3(i)) MITd &1 T3 : WHYR™ k!

2.

(2) %01 Rrfwr, 2014  qwr Tk a1z & el ey
) o7 rorr, 1952 ¥ (wagueia 75t Fror ¥ v F w2fita) 477-3 ¥ 39477 2 ¥ ke &

ﬁwﬁmﬁﬂﬁ"&gm?ﬁﬂ?@%wmﬂmmwmzvﬁ?mﬁm%qmﬁm

3

Wﬁww&:hmws%m(mﬁmm&?.mwuuﬁ“mﬁarﬁwﬁwﬁﬁm.

1952 % 27-%" ¥ s “dfr Ryt ¥a g R 9 2z gorme 59 ¥ 3@y s0qaT W B g s
ekl '

4.

T AT & 4Ty 11 % -

(%) 59777 (1) 3R 7% gegw ¥ Rrg R sR=fi g Jew, A

(1) e Frry A 4 o wift S g ot dory PR e 7 Bl S art & wr
Riﬁ#tgiﬁsraﬁ:ifﬁmﬁmmﬁm#mﬁw‘tz%unmnﬁaﬁwﬁ%ﬁmmw
wTAE & grm ofk ¥om 9 oy Prdor 01 Rrasae, 2014 7% Y T Yo ey T o

mwrﬁmmmwﬁtm:m.ﬂ%aﬁmagmﬂrﬁvﬁvﬁwfhmmmﬁm

i arafir & frg sferFas ug gome ¥ ¥R F sramfts g

Fo1d 6 wrd wew Fer Ry & qwoqa awny 80 B Ffd & wrp g od i afi ¥ e
vriﬂ?'a‘ﬁww@a}wmﬂ%ﬂmﬁﬁﬁqm&m%ifwmﬁzﬁrmm#
T 97 ¥ o A < & el v o, A gwk Yot v ¥ By B deg 3§ w9 § qr
ST,

(@) m-ﬁn&)ﬁa@fﬁéﬁﬁ'mm“Maﬁrﬂmmﬁm%ﬁ“anwwmwﬁwnﬁaﬁm
AT
(W) SY-477 (3) H -

(i) R R w ag I TN W w6500 T ¥ RA 9% “d9g et wY
whaem e R ang;

() oegE g2 Ay e
() 33-497 (3) F AT, AR g4y smmair fer o, Amw -
"(4) 1 e, 2014 Fr (el ¥ srgre AT weer S R o TR % R T ag g
mmmﬁwﬁmgﬁmm%wvﬁmﬁﬁﬁ,%ﬁvﬁmqﬁmrﬁméwwﬁ
W%qwﬁmﬁmﬁaw%mvwammwﬁmﬁmmwmﬁmﬁmﬁ
TG HE

AT P ITYT WER WY, TRy §0C WY 7 oo T AT 6 Rafy § o7 afew ¥
TIAHT a7 A AT e Bt ¥ st wevs vy % fro sieRe g o siver & &
uﬁrﬂws&wiﬁwﬁtmvﬁmﬁﬂﬁéwi—ﬂﬁm

R P A Rew &7 wivr 1 R, 2014 g wmz 91 ol ¥ v Prar oo

asﬁwﬁ%%ﬁwuﬁwﬁﬁrumgﬁmﬁﬁﬁﬁawﬁrmﬁm%mﬁ
mf&mmﬂwﬁuﬁmamvﬁwwzvﬁmmz}:

aaﬁw%ﬁ%vﬁmm(ﬁwﬁamﬁmﬁ).ﬁﬁ%ﬁwwaﬁﬁwm@ﬁr‘m
t{mtvm;m%W%Wﬁmﬁm%m#smﬁ?ﬁﬁﬁ?ﬁ?’éfﬁm%mnﬁmﬁfﬁﬁ
TH O 997 HAT @ 0 & g g g sterers 51 wiard wfer BRY gremn 5 sata g
R X T 1w s B wve & widsy Rfy amd i st fvar srom)



THE GAI.’F,TTF.QE IND!.-‘\_'FRTRAORIWINAV_Z Y o LPM Ho-Toe3h)

5. AT ¥ 42 12 % 3947 (2) # Frafis wo s R s A
v f5 37 wREw A fAE Yo W smemc we 1 frER, 2014 @ YsrT Ao dar § Ry
%mﬁﬂ@ﬁm@#%w?ﬂ#ﬂwﬁwﬁaﬂ%mﬁm%%mgﬂ
¥4 9fdarg ¥ SRR o ox et € aeft) :

6. T 9T § &Ry 14 F R Refefa do sRenf fr sro, s
“14. wewg g wtRw Forr ¥ g o 8% & o & o o AW A are o A mere B
T AR A Y % oraar 58 o g g W, N R wyd A, W A 12 F wwdoy (1) §

R s s A1 3, a1 7g aeey wfveT W § qw Rfyg e arw o v w0 gEr o

et 7 I Ry #Y 58 TG i 1y 1t 7 w=A ¥ svenfiw Ty F1 TR0 7w @7 71 ey 3
HEAT & )

3418 B QR seamgrer A o & Rro dar G & mw 99aT S vAE A dtar
il £l o 3% Fa  wifka stera F wwm g

T Ay T % a T e, i) afkan ey den, 1971 % sty Rt &9 %
Rrg arfarsr & & srqare mﬁ-ﬁarﬁ{ﬁﬁmﬁ%wﬁwﬁxﬁﬁmnﬁﬁw'@' g fam
T g1 T storraY a7 wfafe wfaww Wi o
[T, 5. TH-35012/1/2012-vHTH-|[)
6V FRTT =T, 377 AT
feroquft:- w= Ao A Rt 16 7T, 1995 1 wfge gew wLALRL 748(x) qrT vl e

an ar fraelt are i Ratw 14 wxadt, 2013 & sfvger g wra Y. 80(.) grer Sovf Rrar
qry

NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 22nd August, 2014

G.S.R. 609(E).— In exercise of powers conferred by section 6A read with sub-section (1) of sccrion 7 of the
Employees’ Provident Funds and Miscellaneous Provisions Act, 1952 (19 of 1952), the Central Gasernment hereby
makes the following Scheme further 10 amend the Employees' Pension Scheme, 1995. namely:—

1. " (1) This Scheme may be called the Employees’ Pension (Amendment) Scheme, 201 4.
(2) 1 shall come into force on and from the | day of September, 2014,

2. In the Employees' Pension Scheme, 1995, (hereinafier referred to as the principal Scheme). in puragraph 3, in

sub-paragraph 2, in the proviso, for the words “‘rupees six thousend and five hundred”, whercver they occur, ihe words
“fifieen thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

3. In the principal Scheme, in paragraph 6, in clause (v), after the wards, figures and leuer “or 27A of the
Employces' Provident Funds Scheme, 1952", the words “and whose pay on such date Is less than or cqual to fifteen
thousand rupees”, shall be inserted.

4.+ Inthe principal Scheme, in paragraph 1 | -

(2) for subi-parapraph (1) and the proviso thereto, the following shall be substituted, namelv:-

(1) The pensionable salary shall be the aversge monthly pay drawn in ony manner including on preve rine basis
during conuibutory period of service in the span of sixty months preceding the date of exii trom the membership
ol the Pension Fund and the pensionable salary shall be determined on pro-r:

113 basis for the pensionable service
up to the 1" day of September, 2014, subject 10 a maximum of six chausand and five hundred rupees per month

and {or the period thereafier at the maximum of fifteen thousand rupees per month:

Provided that if 8 member was not in receipt of full pay during the period of sixty months preceding the
day he ceased 1o be the member of the Pension Fund, the average of previous sixty months full pay drawn by
him during the period for which contribution 10 the pension fund was recovered, shall be taken into account as
pensionable salary for calculating pension;



(w0 11-wvg 3(j)] W@ F1 TSR+ "GO 5

(b) in sub-paragraph (2), for the figures and word “12 months®
shall be substituted; :
() in sub-paragraph (3),- :
() for the words, letters and figurcs “rupees six thousand and five hundred/Rs, 6500™, the words “fifteen
thousand rupees* shall be substituted:
(il) the proviso shall be omitted,
(d) aler sub-paragraph (3), the following sub-paragraph shall be Inserted, ey
“(4) The existing members as on the 1* day of September, 2014, who wt the option of the employer and
employee, hud been contributing on salary exceeding six thousand and five hundred rupees per month, may on a

fresh option to be exercised juintly by the employer and employee continue lo contribute on salary exceeding
fifteen thousand rupecs per month:

, wherever they accur, the words “sixty months"

Provided that the aforesaid members have to contribute at the rate of 1,16 per cent on salary excecding
fiftecn thousand rupees as an additional contribution om and out of the contributions payable by the employees
far each month under the provisions of tie Act or the rules made thereunder:

Provided further that the fresh optivn shatl be exercised by the member within 4 peried of six months
from the 1" day of September, 2014;

Provided also that the period specified in the second proviso may, on sufficicat cause being shown by

the member, be extended by the Regional Provident Fund Commissioner far a further period not exceeding six
months:

Provided also that i no option is exertised by the member within such period (including the extended
perind), it shall be deemed thar the member has not opted for contribition over wage ceiling and the
contributions 1o the Pension Fund made over the wage ceiling in vespect of the member shall be divected 6 the

Pravident Fund account of the member along with interest as declared under the Employees™ Provident Fund
Scheme from time to time.

In the principal Scheme in paragraph 12, in sub-paragraph (2), the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:-

“Provided that the members’ monthly pension shall be derermined on & pro-rata basis for the pensionable
service up 10 the 1" day of September, 2014 ar the maximum pensionsble salary of six thousand and live

hundred rupees per month and for the period thereafter at the maximum pensionable salary of fificen thousand
rupees per month”,

6. Inthe principal Scheme, for paragraph 14 the following paragraph shall be subslituted, namely.-

“14. Benefits on leaving service before being eligible for monthly member's pension.- [{a member has ne
rendered the eligible service specified in sub-paragraph (1) of paragraph 12 on the date of exit, or an auaining
the 58 years of age, whichever is carlier, such member shall be entitted 1o 3 withdrawal beaefit as laid down in
Table "D or may opt 1o receive the Scheme certificate provided on the date he has not anained S8 years of age:

Provided that for calculating such withdrawal benefit, the wages ai cxit shall be the weighted average
of his wages at the end of every wage ceiling period:

Provided further that an existing member shall recelve additivnal return of contributions for his past
service under the Employees® Family Pension Scheme, 1971, computed as withdrawal-cum-retirement benefits
as per Table ‘A" multlplied by the factor given in Table '8" .

{F.No, §-35012/1/2012-SS-11}

ARUN KUMAR SINHA,AddI. Secy,

Note: The principal Scheme was published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part {1, Scction 3, Sub-section (5). vide
notification number G.S.R. 748 (£), dated the 16th November, 1995 and last smended vide nalification number G.S.R.
B0(E:) dated the t4th February, 2013,

a§ frelt, 22 e, 2014
HL.F.R.810(%). —Fi=r wfiw fRfy aur v 3oy wfraw, 1952 (1952 = 19) #
YT 7 1 IY-uTT (1) ¥ ouTT afyw v e T WEE Rt AT WA wr 2v Fe oA
T (8 Remg 9w 9T, 1976 # st WeuR @ % Pro Rafafim drmm a7 ¢ ;-
L) 3y B wEEl (RE wgag T (sdne) S, 2014 Fgerfi)
3297 457;1,,;_



6 B THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY _ [PART l—SKC. 3()]

) wg 1 faw, 2014 ¥ st gnfh
2w Py wgag I dremn, 1076 ¥ (qaguchr gew Qe ¥ w9 defit) e 7 ¥, 9y
4T (1) & g T AT A w0 F RO O R T A 4 sTeTRte R s
3. T A ¥ e 22 ¥, -t (3) F, -

(¥) @ve (i) &, "G g 9T A 0y e ¥ wqrw w7 ~4Eg genT STy ver whawatita fer

s

() =érFTw ¥, mg g 9T /) w9 el ¥ w97 vy g0 v a shenRy R

T
4, e DT ¥ dwuTs 22 #, 994w (3) ¥ aix, Prwfafee sw-dours stacenfa R s,
AT

"(4) T AT ¥ e L RTTE 22 (1), (2) F9ay (3), dA7 o wAer @, F sy
AT % &raT 7 A wiRers TET Ry syem

(1", t=-35012/1/2012 "HQH-(] ]

frooft:, el Reva-dag 1 Promr, 1976 Raiw 28 J@rs, 1976 swuy wn.37.fa 488() T WA

TN, IETYTIO, NI 1, 999 3, IX gvT (i) ® vl § 0§ f o 37 7 & Brmgae amita G
T 4T

() @A 1788, Raiw07.12.1976
()  &ranfr 648, T 01.05.1977
(3)  wrwLfA, 329, RT® 20.02.1978
4y  srwLER. 369, RATw 14.07.1978
5y ®r+.iR. 67, fReiw 23.12.1978
(6)  WLFLE. 1013, Priw 12.09.1980
() WLELR. 540, A 03.10,1981
(8) wrwLfR, 828, RRAIT 14.08.1985
(9  @uELf. 873, fRatw 29.08.1986
(10)  wraLf, 228, Rate 02.03.1989
(11) wrwLfA, 354, Reiw 22.05.1990
(12)  =vELEE, 30, Reiw 28.12.1990
(13)  =FLfR, 321, BRTw 16.08.1991
(14)  =LFLER 420, 1% 31.08.1992
(s  #LFLEL 176, RAi® 07.03.1994
(16) ArF1.R. 334, ¥ 20.08.1997
(i1 wLFLA. 238, RATF 13.06.2000
(18) mFLRR, 523(=), R34 18.06.2010
(19 anFLfR, 9(), =+ 08.01.2011
(20)  ALELER. 83(), P 11.02.2011



(-

(v -'wE 3(i)] WRY %1 JaE : HARURD 7

NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 22nd August, 2014

G.5.R. 610 (E), —In exercise of the powers conferred by section 6C read with sub-scction (1) of section 7 of
the Employees' Provident Funds and Miscellaneous Provisions Act, 1952 (19 of 1952), the Central Govemment hereby
makes the following scheme further (o umend the Employses' Deposit-Linksd Insuiunce S-chcmr,l‘:l‘f(a. namely:-

1. (1) This Scheme may be called the Employees’ Deposit-Linked Insurance (Amendment) Scheme, 2014,
(2) It shall come fnto force on end from the 1* day of September, 2014,

2 In the Ersployees’ Deposit-Linked Innurance Scheme, 1976 (hereinafter referred 10 as the principal Scheme), in
paragraph 7, in sub-paragraph (1), for the words “six thousand five bundred rupces”, the words “fifteen thousand rupees”
shall be substituted.

3. In the principal Scheme, in paragraph 22, in sub-paragreph (3),-

(a) in clause (i), for the words “six thousand five hundsed rupees”, the words.*fifteen thousand rupees™ shall be
substituted;

(b) in the Explanation, for the words “rupecs six thousand five hundred”, the words *fiftcen thousand rupees”
shall be substituted.

4. In the principal Scheme, in paragraph 22, after sub-paragraph (3), the tollowing sub-paragraph shall be inserted,
namely:-

"(4) The benefit under this Scheme shall be further increased by twenty percent in addition to the bene!its
admissible under sub-paragraph (1), (2) or (3) of paragraph 22, as the case may be.".

[F. No, §-35012/1/2012-58 11}
ARUN KUMAR SINHA, Addl, Secy.

Note:- The Employees’ Deposit-Linked Insurance Scheme, 1976 was published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary,
Part 1), Section 3, Sub-section (i); vide number G.S.R. 488 (E) , dated the 28% fuly, 1976 and subsequently amended as
follows:~

n GSR 1788, dated 07-12-1976
) GSR 648, dated 01-05-1977
) GSR 329, dated 20-02-1978
4) GSR 369, dated 14-07-1978
(5) GSR 67, dated 23-12-1978
6) GSR 1013, dated 12-09-1980
) GSR 548, dated 03-10-1981
(8) GSR 828, dated 14-08-1985
9 GSR 873, dated 29-08-1986
(10) GSR 228, dated 02-03-1989
(n GSR 354, dated 22-05-199G
(12) GSR 30, dated 28-12-1990
(13) GSR 321, dated 16-08-1991
(14) GSR 420, dated 31-08-1992
(18 GSR 176, dated 07-03-1994
(16) GSR 334, dated 25-08-1997
(In GSR 238, dated 13-06-2000
(18) GSR 523(E), dated 18-06-2010
(19 GSR 9(E), dated 08-01-2011
(20) GSR 83(E), dated 11-02-2011

Printed by the Manager, Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayupuri, New Delbi-110064
and Published by the Conmolier of Publicatians. Delhie| 10054.



T e To To-33004/99

Che Gazette of Fudia

ITATEATOT
EXTRAORDINARY
W [[—@UE 3—IY-Q@UY (i)
PART Hl—Sectlon 3—Sub-section (i)
wirwr | wefima
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

¥, 429) o fwell, W, TTE 19, 2014/5WAT 28, 1936
No. 429] NEW DELHI, TUESDAY, AUGUST 19, 2014/SHRAVANA 28, 1936
519 R e WA
it
7 s, 19 7, 2014
AL.593(3),—Fofarlt wfrsy fify qen w@i So=y afiafam, 1952 (1952 37 19) F 90 7 ®
SU-HTT (1) % WY 930 URT 6% G WS WA 1 WA W gq R www wH Sy @, 1995 5 s
wNYA & & fey Prerfafad domn and #, sk o
I (1) 9% drarn Frd Yo dieen (fdtr wnivA) @, 2016 swemed
(2) 77 1 fqe, 2014 R} vl = S o )
2 FIER) Y913 A9, 1995 (Tagead Wod AR @ e ¥ w3he) § s 10 8 5% S (7)
& 3w, frfafem 3u R of wenfen fea sngm, awfq-

(7)) T8 QIITE @ avarta fee fieman stern v meem s w) farelt S e wfin sz ) aifge
gy fodte =4 2014-15 WA T & g9R TR @ wW T o

Bl q&a A % YW 1S ¥, " ¥ 12 % 39 S (2) €408) ¥ wenfeufat, vy, e |
st % faw Qe 12" W uE ot fiveurfig feg o
L e AET ® R 16 §-

(%) T TTE (2) §, @ (F) t‘”ﬂm (iv) % 3909, frefatas v @vs o wuifia 5 o,

quid ;-
" ()@ Bt FEl § o we, ot @), wfew i faen Y wfve w e e § = 5, 39 R
T4 2014-15 & Wau § wgret wRIER UF F9N 79 HY K e
(@) 99w (3) W, GUE (@) F fory, Frofefen wve whmaf ST, R4

@) wrw T g il T EYR I T (2) @ v cF) # simfe S nfes e v ® ww
fea7a e 1 frvan ) ar{aey of| & 25 viavd @ wo R

AR G4 n



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA:EXTRAORDINARY [Py H—Sic, 3(i)]

- v@m%ﬁ%mmﬁﬁmwﬁ%hm,u&ﬁ,mwmmﬂﬂ fadra 7 201415 R Hay
W wft o 3 W vem v R w9 T e

m wm(a)ﬂ.m(x)%m,mmwﬁmﬁa%mm.amn:—

(m)uﬁmmﬁinﬁmﬁhwmﬁ;wﬁmqﬁmwﬁ‘mﬁmmﬁﬁmﬂzﬂm}mjrm
mﬁmh#ﬁﬁ,mmwmm%m(w)%mmfawﬁm%wﬁwﬁrmsm
T & TR F v g

Wwﬁ«mmﬁmr{m,nﬁﬂ,mmwmmﬁm Fadta &d 2014 15 @ waw o whmmg
RLE R SRR R B

(WL € AR-15025/3/2007- Q- [V/5m-1]]

e gan o6, s wivw
g feeror : wferll Yo e, 1995 8 e 16 =T, 1995 W Hfeem wem wow.f, 748( ) wo vEfE far T

o 3 froeh wx vad fiw 14 o, 2013 9 Hfbgen Hem ww LR 80(R) B 3w W R T
121}

MINISTRY OF LABOURAND EMPLOYMENT
NOTIRICATION
New Deihl, the 19th August, 2014,

GS.R. 593 (E):— In exercise of the powers conferred by section 6A, read with sub-section {1) of section 7 of the
Employecs® Providem Funds and Miscellaneous Provisions Act, 1952¢19 0 1952), the Central Government hereby makes
the {ollowing Scheme further 1o amend the Employees® Pension Seheme, 1995, narmely:-

1. (1) This Scheme may be celled the Employees® Pension (Second Amendment) Scheme, 2014,

(2) It shalt come into force on the {5t day of September, 2014,
a

22 Inthe Employees' Pension Scheme, 1995 (hereinafier referred to ns the principal Scheme), in paragraph
12, after sub-peragraph (7), the following sub-paragraph shall be inserted, namely:-

“(7A) The montbly member's pension including any relief payable to any existing or futwre member under this
paragraph shall not be less than one thousand rupees for the financial year 201415,

3. Inthe principal Scheme, in paragraph 13, for the words, brackets and figures “sub-paragraphs (2) to (5) of
peragraph 12, a3 the case may be,", the word and figures * paragraph 12" shall be substituted.

4, In the principal Scheme, in paragraph 16,

(a) in sub-paragraph (2). in clause (2), afier sub-clause (iv), the following sub-clause shall be inserted;
namely:-

“(v) in all the cases, where the monthly widow pension including relief, if any,
per month, the amount of monthly widow pension in such cases shall be enh
month for the financial year 2014-201 3.5

is less than one thousand rupees
anced to one thousand rupees per

®) in sub-paragraph (3), for cleuse (b), the following clause shall be substituted, nainely:-

“(b) Monthty children pension for ea

ch child shall be equal 10 25 per cent of the amount admissible to the widow
of the deceased member as monthly

widow pension payable under clause (8) of sub-paragraph (2);

Provided thal the minimum mouthly children pension including relief, if any, for cach child of the deceased
member shall not be less than two hundred ard fiRy rupees per moath for the financial year 2014-2015.;

{c) in sub-paragraph (4), for clause (e), the following clause shal} be substituted, namely:-



(¥ {-Tv 3(i)] _ WA FTATN ¢ IwTm 3

*(n) if the deceased member is not survived by any widow, but is survived by children falling within the definition
of family or if the widow pension is not payable, the children shall be entitled to amonthly orhan pension equal to 75 per
cent of the amount of the monthly widow pension as payable under clause (a) of stb-paragraph (2);

Frovided that the minimum monthly orphan pension including relief, if any, for each orphan shail not be less than

seven hundred and fifty rupees per month for the financial year2014-15.".
[F. No. R-15025/3/2007.8S-1/PLII)
ARUN KUMAR SINHA ,Addl. Secy.

Foot Note.- The Employees’ Pension Scheme, 1995 was published in the Gazette of India vide notification number G.S.R.
T48(E), dated the 16th November, 1995 and was lastly amended vide notification number G.S.R. 80(E), dated the

l4th February, 2013,

— e ————

Prioted by the Manager, Government of India Press, Ring Roud, Mayapuet, New Delhi-§ 10064
and Published by the Controller of Publicatiuns, Delhyi-110054




1.1

1.2

1.3

1.4

1.5

1.6

1.7

1.8

ANNEXURE - (il

HOW TO PREVENT MISAPPROPRIATION OF P.F. DUES BY THE CONTRACTORS

In the tender for labour/ manpower supply contracts, compliance by contractors
regarding compliance of EPF & MP Act’'1952, needs be specified alongwith other labour
laws, Names of contractors covered under the EPF & MP Act can be searched and
downloaded from website — epfindia.gov.in.

Principal employers/ D.D.O’s should get a copy of ECR, e- challan and salary/ wages
register reflecting P.F. deductions before releasing payments to contractors.

Under the statutory provisions, employee wise details of PF dues deducted from the
salary/ wages of the employees, alongwith 12% employer share are submitted in the form
of electronic challan cum return (ECR), thereafter, e — challan is generated from the EPF
website. Since the consolidated ECR’s of the contractor regarding manpower supplied to
all public and private sectors will be very bulky and will create confusion/ excessive time
and energy consumption at the level of DDOs, hence separate ECR’s and a separate e-
challan as stated above are very important to prevent manipulations. Cheating by the
contractors can be prevented by demanding separate ECR and e-challan every month in
respect of manpower deployed in a particular office/ departments for which DDO is to
release the payments to the contractors.

DDOs can check the name of all the employees with regard to ECR from the website of
EPFO i.e. epfindia.gov.in.

EPF Organisation has provided a facility to the payment of dues with reference to
transaction number of e- challans. Whenever any challan is received alongwith ECR for
crediting PF dues in the accounts of individual members, a TRRN No. is generated for e-
challan. With reference to this TRRN No. actual deposit can be verified from the EPFO
website to prevent submission of fake challans by the contractors.

From April’2012 onwards, monthly contributions received throuogh ECR and e-challans
are being credited in the individual members account within one month from the date of
deposit. Individual members can also verify the same by registration on the EPF website.
A DDO can ask any member at random to check whether the dues are being deposited by
the contractor fully without any manipulation/ mis-appropriation.

At the end of the year, EPFO generates statement of accounts of individual members
account reflecting opening balance, contributions, withdrawals, interest and closing
balance etc. DDO should ask for distribution of these annual statements of accounts in the
Office/ Department. '

Employees may be guided to obtain e-passbooks from EPFO website.



PROFORMA FOR DDOs TO ENSURE COMPLIANCE FROIVi THE CONTRACTOR ESTASLISHEMINT

Name of the Hospital/Deptt alongwith address

Name and address of the Contractor - Vi/s

PF Code no. of the Contractor establishment

Financial Year/period ;

RN EXUL ~ fty

Total PF

S.No.| Emp_ | Name | Fathers PF Wages (Monthwise) fotal |Total |Total Actual
PFno | ofthe | name (PF Wages of March paid in April & so on) \Wages |Employ |[Employer |dues PF Dues
emp ee Share deposite
Share d
Mar Apr May Jun Jul Aug Sep Oct | Nov | Dec | Jan Feb | (Sumof 5 (12% of | (13.61% of | (Sum of
©©16) Ign. 27)| S.no.17) | 18+19)
(1) _ (2) {3) (4) {5) {8 | (7) (8) (9) | (10) | (11) | (12)|(13)](24) | (25) | (16)| (17) (18) (19) (20) (21)
1 o 0 0 0
| < 0 0 6 4]
- _ 0 0 0 0
4 L 0 0 0 0
> i 0 0 0 0
Total | [ 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Signature of the DDO
Name and stamp of the Official




Bhavishya Nidhi Bhawan, 28, Community Centre,
A0 E-Mail: ro.delhi.north@epfindia.gov.in , Tele n

List of Pincode

falls windei the Temioiial Jurisdicaon ol

Regional office Delhi

(North)

Name of the RPFC - Dr. V.P. Singh, RPFC-I

Annexure-V

Wazirpur Industrial Area, Delhi-110052
0.:- 011-27376772, Fax - 011-27376777

S.No. Pincode Area S.No. | Pincode Area
1 110001 Connaught Place 28 110039 Bawana/Barwala
2 110002 Darya Ganj 29 110040 Narela/Bhorgarh
3 110003 Lodhi Road 30 110041 Peeragarhi/Nangloi
4 110004 Rashtrapati Bhawan 31 | 110042 | Badli/Pehladpur/Siraspur
5 110005 Karol Bagh 32 | 110043 Najafga: 1 ]
6 | 110006 ~ Chandni Chowk 33 | 110045 Pzlam Vil': ge
7 110007 Shakti Nagar/Kamla Nagar 34 110046 Nangai Raya/S: garpur
Ashok Vihar/Wazirpur indl
8 | 110008 gatel Nagar 35 | 110052 B
Civil Lines/Timarpur
9 | 110009 Mogelfown 36 | 110054 [University i
10 110010 Dhaula Kuan, Delhi Cantt 37 110055 Pahargarj
11 110011 South Avenue, Niraman Bhawan 38 110056 Shakur Basti
12 110012 Inderuri, ARI(PUSA) 39 110058 Janakpuri/Tihar Jail Road |
Nizamuddin Jeevan
13 110013 g TS5 Park/Matiyala/Uitam Nagar
110015 Kirti Nagar/moti Nagar 41 110060 Rajinder N-gar
14 110018 Tilak Nagar/Khyala 42 110061 | Shahbad Mohar:madpur
15 110021 Chanakyapuri /moti Bagh 43 110063 Madipur/Paschim Vihar
16 110022 R.K.Puriam/South Delhi Campus 44 110064 Mayapuri/Harinagar
* . ) Bhikaji Cama Place/
17 | 110023 “idwal [lagan 45 | 110066 ‘Mohammadpur
18 110026 Punjabi Bagh 46 110071 Chawla/Jharoda
19 110027 Rajouri Garden/Subhash Nagar 47 110073 Dhansa/lssapur/Raota
20 110028 Najafgarh 48 110075 Dwarka
21 110029 Safdarjung Enclave 49 110078 Kakrola/NSIT Dwarka
Geora/Jaunti/Kanjhawla/
22 | 110033 Adarsh pagas/Aeadpus 50 | 110081 Mubarakpur
23 110034 Shakurpur/Rani bagh/Pitampura £q NTOD Holambi Kalan/Naya Bans
24 110035 Keshavpuram/inderlok/Rampura 52 110083 Mangolhuri
25 110036 Alipur/Bakhtawarpur 53 110084 Burari/Jharoda Majraa
26 110037 Mahipalpur/IGI Airport 54 110085 Rohini/Rithala
Begumpur/Budh
27 | 110038 alol: 55 | 110086 Vihar/Sultarpuri
28 110039 Bawana/Barwala 56 110087 Ywalapuri/Sunder Vihar
57 110088 Haiderpur/Shalimar bagh




List of Pincode falls under the territorial jurisdiction of

Regional office Delhi (South)

Name of the RPFC - Shri Beerbal Meena, RPFC-I

EPFO Complex, Plot nO. 23, Sector-23, Dwarka, New Delhi-110075

Email : ro.delhi.south@epfindia.gov.in , Tele :- 011-28050759 Fax : 011-28050412

S.No. [Pincode [Area
1 110016|Green Park/Haus Khas
2| 110017|Malviya Nagar/Saket/Chirag Delhi
3 110018|Nehru Place, Tuglakabad Extn,
4 110020(0Okhala Industrial Area
5 110025(Jamia Nagar
6 110030|Mehrauli
7 110038|8Bijwasan
8 110044 Badarpur/Mohan Cooperative
9 110047|Aya Nagar, Arjun Garh
10 110048 |Greater Kailash
11 110049 (South Extn./Shahpurjat
12 110057|Vasant Vihar
13| 110062 |Khanpur/Dakshinpuri
14 110065|New Friends Colony/East of Kailash
15[  110067|Munirka, JNU
16 110068|Neb Sarasi/IGNOU
17 110070|Vasant Kunj/Masudpur
19 110074|Chattarpur/Satbari
20 110079

List of Pincode falls under the Territorial jurisdiction of

Sub-Regional office Jhilmil

Name of the RPFC - Smt. Nidhi Singh, RPFC-1{/0IC

DSIIDC Facility Centre Building, Flatted Factory Complex, 2nd & 3rd Floor, Jhitmil Industrial Area

(Behind Dilshad Garden Metro Station), Delhi-110095

email : sro.laxminagar@epfindia.gov.in , Tele :011-22126504 , Fax :- 011-22126502

S.No. |Pincode Area

110014 |Bhogal/Jangupra

110024 |Lajpat Nagar

110031 |Gandhi Nagar

110032 (Shahadra

110051|Krishna Nasgar

110053|Ghonda

110091 |Mayur Vihar

110092 |Patparganj/Laxmi nagar

Wb lw|N]| -

110093[Nand Nagari

110094 |Karawal Nagar

[ay
o

110095 [Jhilmil (Dilshad Garden)

[EEY
=

110096 Mayur Vihar, Ph-llI

=
N






